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The second in Dr. Criswell's Controversies series, Controversies in the Prophets compares and contrasts the
various interpretations of the Hebrew prophets from Isaiah to Malachi. He includes both Jewish and
Christian scholars. Which prophecies were fulfilled under Christ? Was the name of Jesus prophesied in
Habakkuk? Did Daniel predict the very day that the Messiah would be slain? Was the restoration of Israel in
1948 a prophetic calendar event? With 2500 endnotes, quotes from hundreds of scholars, and many charts
Controversies in the Prophets is a valuable resource for the professor, pastor, or interested layman.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Campanelli:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Controversies in the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi. You
can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important some
sort of book Controversies in the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi. You can add know-how and of course
you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor until wonderful
thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's study.

Arlene Wilson:

Here thing why this Controversies in the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content
is as scrumptious as food or not. Controversies in the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi giving you
information deeper and different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that
similar with Controversies in the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi. It gives you thrill reading through
journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is possibly can
be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by
train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Controversies in
the Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi in e-book can be your alternative.

Na Urquhart:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Controversies in the Prophets:
Isaiah through Malachi book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data
in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Garry Brown:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining
a book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere?
It ok you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Controversies in the
Prophets: Isaiah through Malachi which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
see.
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