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Ivy and Martha are not ordinary friends, Ivy is changeling with supernatural powers—or is she?

Martha is incredibly unpopular. She’s overweight, buck-toothed, and shy. Ivy is an outcast. Her family lives
on the outskirts of town amid a field of derelict orchards. But starting in second grade, the girls form a bond
that allows them to take control of their own lives.
 
It all begins when Ivy tells Martha that she is no ordinary girl: She claims she’s a changeling, switched with
the real Ivy at birth. With the strength of Ivy’s friendship, Martha becomes more confident and sure of
herself. And through their bond, Ivy gains the normalcy she needs, away from life with her tumultuous
family. When the two girls play, they enter an elaborate fantasy world all their own. But when the real world
threatens to split them apart, their friendship becomes more important than ever.
 
This ebook features an extended biography of Zilpha Keatley Snyder.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Oliveras:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Changeling. All
type of book would you see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Robert Bell:

Precisely why? Because this The Changeling is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for
you to snap this but latter it will zap you with the secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic
author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content on the inside easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having
this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book
include such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to delay
having that book? If I had been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Arlene Farrar:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside appear likes.
Maybe you answer can be The Changeling why because the amazing cover that make you consider
concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the
outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Mildred Kershner:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book The Changeling to make your own reading is
interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the idea about book and reading through especially. It is
to be 1st opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the guide The Changeling can to be
your brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of this time.
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