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Even though England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales were under a common Parliament in the nineteenth
century, cultural, economic, and historical differences led to very different values and assumptions about
crime and punishment. For example, though the Scots were the most likely to convict accused killers,
English, Welsh, and Irish killers were two and a half times more likely to be executed for their crimes. In
Certain Other Countries, Carolyn A. Conley explores how the concepts of national identity and criminal
violence influenced each other in the Victorian-era United Kingdom. It also addresses the differences among
the nations as well as the ways that homicide trials illuminate the issues of gender, ethnicity, family, privacy,
property, and class. Homicides reflect assumptions about the proper balance of power in various
relationships. For example, Englishmen were ten times more likely to kill women they were courting than
were men in the Celtic nations.     
By combining quantitative techniques in the analysis of over seven thousand cases, as well as careful and
detailed readings of individual cases, the book exposes trends and patterns that might not have been evident
in works using only one method. For instance, by examining all homicide trials rather than concentrating
exclusively on a few highly celebrated ones, it becomes clear that most female killers were not viewed with
particular horror, but were treated much like their male counterparts.
            The conclusions offer challenges and correctives to existing scholarship on gender, ethnicity, class,
and violence. The book also demonstrates that the Welsh, Scots, and English remained quite distinct long
after their melding as Britons was announced and celebrated. By blending a study of trends in violent
behavior with ideas about national identity, Conley brings together rich and hotly debated fields of modern
history. This book will be valuable both for scholars of crime and violence as well as for those studying
British history.
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From reader reviews:

Cinthia Beltran:

The book CERTAIN OTHER COUNTRIES: Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late Nineteenth-
Century England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales (HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS) can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a
good thing like a book CERTAIN OTHER COUNTRIES: Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late
Nineteenth-Century England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales (HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS)? A
number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many data for us. It
is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that,
you can give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book CERTAIN OTHER COUNTRIES:
Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late Nineteenth-Century England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales
(HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Mary Deleon:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How people
have to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this CERTAIN OTHER COUNTRIES:
Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late Nineteenth-Century England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales
(HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS) book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of
course the info in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Shaun Richards:

You can find this CERTAIN OTHER COUNTRIES: Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late
Nineteenth-Century England, Ireland, Scotland, and Wales (HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS) by visit
the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for
the knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by means of written or printed but additionally can
you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking of your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about
your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's
try to choose suitable ways for you.

Virginia Shrader:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the



library as well as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has
reading's internal or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They
go to at this time there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important,
boring along with can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very
important for yourself. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever you want.
Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this CERTAIN OTHER
COUNTRIES: Homicide, Gender, and National Identity in Late Nineteenth-Century England, Ireland,
Scotland, and Wales (HISTORY CRIME & CRIMINAL JUS) can make you sense more interested to read.
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